
VW – T-Roc 2.0 TDI Sport 4Motion R-
Line
T-Roc 2.0 TDI Sport 4Motion R-Line

N0V Seat centre panels of the front seats and the outer rear
seats in Carbon Flag fabric, inner bolsters in ArtVelours, 4A3
Heated front seats, 3S2 Black roof rails, 4E7 Luggage
compartment lid, electrically opening and closing, Luggage
compartment lid, electrically opening and closing, Luggage
compartment lid, electrically opening and closing, 4F2 Keyless
locking and starting system Keyless Access, Keyless locking and
starting system Keyless Access, Keyless locking and starting
system Keyless Access with SafeLock, 9AK Air Care Climatronic
air conditioning with 2-zone temperature control and allergen
filter, 9S0 Digital Cockpit Pro, multicolour, 9WJ App-Connect
including App-Connect Wireless for Apple CarPlay and Android
Auto, KA1 Rear view camera Rear View, PAM Front centre
armrest including USB-C interface and USB charging socket, PAV
Detachable towing device, PFZ Driver Assistance Package Plus
(exterior mirrors electrically folding and with automatic lowering
function, right, Blind Spot Sensor Plus with Exit Assist and Lane
Assist, LED headlights, automatic headlight range control, high
beam control Light Assist, Emergency Assist, Adaptive Cruise
Control ACC including Stop&Go function, Speed limiter, Traffic
Jam Assist), QR9 Traffic sign recognition, RBD Navigation system
Discover Media including streaming & internet, V30 19-inch
Suzuka alloy wheels in black, WD1 Plus anti-theft alarm system
with interior monitoring, WIJ R-Line package (lower door trim in
body colour, R-Line bumpers, Park Assist front and rear, Shadow
Steel decorative inserts, ambient lighting white, multifunction
steering wheel leather with shift function R-Line), WSP Seat
Comfort Package (front passenger seat backrest folding, lumbar
supports in front), WW1 Winter Package (heated washer jets)

Standard equipment:
Trailer stabilisation programme, Sport equipment line, Automatic

29 900 €

Erstzulassung 14-07-2022

Kilometerstand 31 000

Getriebeart DSG

Kraftstoff Diesel

Antrieb 4Motion

Farbe Deep Black Perleffekt

Gänge 7

Hubraum 1968

KW (PS) 110 (150)

EU Norm Euro 6

HU AU 07/2027

HSN 0603

TSN CEC

VERBRAUCH / EMISSIONEN

Innerorts 5.6

Außerorts 4.5

Kombiniert 4.9

CO2 129



headlight control, Exterior mirrors electrically adjustable and
heated, Chrome trim on side windows, Hill start / hill descent
assist, Chrome trim on rear bumper, Roof lining fabric black,
Wheel anti-theft protection, Driving profile selection, Front and
rear electric windows, Height-adjustable luggage compartment
floor, LED rear lights dark red, Interior mirror automatically
dimming, ISOFIX child seat anchorage on rear seat, Fog lights
with integrated cornering light, Emergency call system, Driver
fatigue detection, Electric parking brake, Pedals in stainless steel,
Progressive steering, Digital radio reception DAB+, Tyre repair kit
Tire Mobility Set, Diesel particulate filter, Rear seat backrest split
with centre armrest, Front sports seats, Sports suspension,
Start/Stop system, Environment monitoring system Front Assist
with City Emergency Braking, Rear tinted glazing 65%,
Immobiliser electronic


