
Porsche – Cayenne E-Hybrid Coupé
Cayenne E-Hybrid Coupé

0NP No differentiation features in Acid Green, 0P9 Sports exhaust
system including black sports tailpipes, 0TD Floor mats, 1BK
Adaptive air suspension with level control and height adjustment
including Porsche Active Suspension Management (PASM), 3J7
Porsche crest on front seat headrests, 3L4 driver memory
package, 3NS 2+1 comfort rear seat system, 42K 21-inch
Cayenne Turbo design wheels in platinum (silk gloss) including
wheel arch extensions in exterior colour, 4A3 front seat heating,
4L6 Automatically dimming interior/exterior mirrors, 5TE
Aluminium Rhombus interior package, KA6 Park Assist including
Surround View, QQ1 Ambient lighting, UD1 LED door projectors
with Porsche lettering, VW1 Privacy glazing

Standard equipment:
Electrically adjustable, heated and folding exterior mirrors, hill
descent control (PHC), hill start assist (Hill Holder), black
anodised brake calipers, Connect Plus (Bluetooth, Apple CarPlay,
WiFi, vehicle tracking system), anti-theft alarm system with
interior monitoring, automatic headlight activation, cruise control,
LED headlights, tailgate with automatic opening and closing
system, adaptive rear spoiler (2-way), automatic climate control,
petrol particulate filter (OPF), panoramic glass roof (fully glazed
roof area), electric parking brake, Porsche Communications
Management (PCM) including online navigation module, tyre
pressure monitoring system, windscreen wipers with rain sensor,
Sport Chrono Package, start/stop system, immobiliser

71 900 €

Erstzulassung 27-12-2021

Kilometerstand 68 350

Getriebeart Automatikgetriebe

Kraftstoff Plug-in Hybrid

Antrieb All-wheel drive

Farbe Quarzitgrau

Gänge 8

Hubraum 2995

KW (PS) 250 (340)

EU Norm Euro 6

HU AU NEU

HSN 0583

TSN AKS

VERBRAUCH / EMISSIONEN

Kombiniert 2.5

CO2 58


